o

e R

3

ik By

4'21

[R5 - s [

BUILDING DEPARTMENT
KOLKATA MUNICIPAL CORPORATION
5,S.N. BANERJEE ROAD
KOLKATA - 700 013

Date : 15/ 12 / 2018

Communiqué

The Kolkata Municipal Corporation (Second Amendment) Act, 2018 published in the

Kolkata Gazette vide notification No.2014-L dated 27t November, 2018 is enclosed

herewith for ready reference and necessary action.

Director General (Building)

Copy to:

1.

G S P M e ORI

DG(Civil)/ Building / South

All Dy. Ch. Engineer (B),

Dy. Ch. Engineer / Ex. Engineer (C) / Bldg. of all Borough offices,
Dy. Manager System (Bldg),

Member, Executive Committee, Council of Architecture,
Chairperson, IIA, West Bengal Chapter,

Secretary, LBS Association,

AQ (I) - for circulation.




Reaistered No. WB/SC-247 No. WB(Part-111)/2018/SAR-28

(Buzette

Extraordinary
Published by Authority

AGRAHAYANA 6] TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 27, 2018 [SAKA 15940

PART III—Acts of the West Bengal Legislature.

GOVERNMENT OF WEST BENGAL
LAW DEPARTMENT
Legislative

NOTIFICATION

No. 2014-L.—27th November, 2018.—The following Act of the West Bengal Legislature, having been assented to
by the Governor, is héreby published for general information:— '

West Bengal Act XXI of 2018

THE KOLKATA MUNICIPAL CORPORATION
(SECOND AMENDMENT) ACT, 2018.

[Passed by the West Bengal Legislature.]

[Assent of the Governor was first published in the Kolkata Gazette,
Extraordinary, of the 27th November, 2018.]

An Act to amend the Kolkata Municipal Corporation Act, 1980.

West Ben. Act

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Kolkata Municipal Corporation Act, 1980, bl ks
o) .

for the purposes and in the manner hereinafter appearing;
It is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India, by the
Legislature of West Bengal, as follows:—

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Kolkata Municipal Corporation (Second

commencement.
Amendment) Act, 2018.




THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, NOVEMBER 27, 2018

Amendment of
section 6 of the
West Ben. Act
LIX of 1980.

Amendment in
the heading of
Chapter III.

Substitution of
new section for
section 26.

Omission of
section 27.

Amendment of
section 13].

Amendment of
section 172.

Amendment of
section 173B.

Insertion of new
section 174A

after section 174.

Amendment of
section 181,

The Kolkata Municipal Corporation
(Second Amendment) Act, 2018.

(Sections 2-10.)

(2) This section shall come into force at once; and the remaining sections shall
come into force on such date or dates as the State Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. In section 6 of the Kolkata Municipal Corporation Act, 1980 (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act),—
(i) the following proviso shall be added:—

“Provided that the elected members of the Corporation may also elect
an individual who is not a member of the Corporation to be the Mayor
provided that he gets himself elected to be a member of the Corporation
within six months from the date of the election, failing which, he shall
cease to be the Mayor of the Corporation.”;

(ii) in the existing proviso,—
(a) for the word “Provided”, the words “Provided further” shall be
substituted,;
(b) after the words “the Corporation” the words “or individual” shall be
inserted. ‘

3. In Chapter III of the Kolkata Municipal Corporation Act, 1980, for the words
in the Heading “B. Municipal Service Commission”, the words “B. Selection by
the West Bengal Municipal Service Commission” shall be substituted.

4. For section 26 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted:—

“Selection of

: 26. The West Bengal Municipal Service Commission constituted
personnel.

under sub-section (1) of section 3 of the West Bengal Municipal
Service Commission Act, 2018, shall select such personnel for the Corporation as
may be prescribed by the State Government, and it shall be binding on the Corporation
to appoint the personnel selected by the said Commission.”.

5. Section 27 of the principal Act shall be omitted.

6. To sub-section (3) of section 131 of the principal Act, the following proviso
shall be added:—

“Provided that the rates under this sub-section may be subject to change in
accordance with the relevant charging provisions.”.

7. In sub-clause (iA) of clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 172 of the
principal Act, for the words “sixty-five years”, the words “sixty years” shall be
substituted. ’

8. In sub-section (1) of section 173B of the principal Act, the second proviso
shall be omitted. '

9. After section 174 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted:—

“Review of
scheme for Base
Unit Area Value.

174A. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 174 or any
other provisions of this Act, the Corporation may, at any time,
review the scheme for specifying Base Unit Area Value by constituting a Committee
of such persons as the Corporation may, with the approval of the State Government,
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.”.

10. In section 181 of the principal Act,—
(i) insub-section (1), for the words ‘by a public notice’, the words ‘by notice’
shall be substituted;
(ii) insub-section (2), for the words ‘by a public notice’, the words ‘by notice’
shall be substituted.

West Ben. Act
XII of 2018.



Part 1H] THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, NOVEMBLER 2/ M0S

The Kolkata Municipal Corporation
(Second Amendment) Aci, (1S

(Sections 11-13)

’;‘:‘;;‘g“;;g‘ at 11. In section 338 of the principal Act, for the words “which shall not be less
than fifty rupees and more than five thousand rupees”, the words “which shall not
be less than five thousand rupees and more than one lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

Substitution of 12. For section 394 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

new section for ;

section 394, substituted:—

;gé’iit’igiﬂgjﬂgribf 394. Every person who intends to execute any of the works specified
repairs of in clause (b) to clause (m) of sub-section (1) of section 390 shall
Pl apply for sanction by giving notice in writing of his intention to the
Municipal Commissioner in such form together with such fees including Drainage
development fee and containing such information as may be prescribed.”.

Amendment of 13. In sub-section (3) of section 398 of the principal Act,—

R (i) for the words “two years”, the words “five years” shall be substituted;

. ‘ (i) the following proviso shall be added:—

“Provided that in case of sanction which requires re-erection or sanction under
this Act of any dilapidated or condemned building, commencement of work should be
made within one year or within such time as may be specified by the Municipal
Commissioner at the time of sanction.”.

By order of the Governor,

SANDIP KUMAR RAY CHAUDHURI,
Secy. to the Govt. of West Bengal,
Law Department.

Published by Law Department, Government of West Bengal and
Printed at Saraswaty Press Ltd. (Government of West Bengal Enterprise), Kolkata 700 056.



